

Bid Tabulation
ONWASA Storage Building
 Onslow Water and Sewer Authority
 12-Nov-20



Single Prime General Contractor	License No.	Certified Check - Bid Bond	Exhibit "A" : MBE Participation Affidavit "A or "B'	Appendix D: E-verify	Base Bid	Alternate 1	Alternate 2	TOTAL
						Owner Preferred Manufacturer: Corbin Russwin	Metal Building Mezzanine Platform and Stairs	Base Bid Cost Plus Alternates
IMEC Group LLC 1219 Colony Drive New Bern, NC 28582	72860	5%	✓	✓	\$966,700.00	\$0.00	\$119,500.00	\$1,086,200.00
Primus Structures 2896 Hwy 24, Suite H Newport, NC 28570	80425	5%	✓	✓	\$993,134.00	\$0.00	\$71,000.00	\$1,064,134.00
TEAM Construction 846 Bell Fork Rd. Jacksonville, NC	75093	5%	✓	✓	\$1,055,579.00	\$0.00	\$92,000.00	\$1,147,579.00
IDIAS Contracting LLC 1 Glenwood Ave. Suite 600 Raleigh, NC 27603								No Bid
Atlantic Contracting & Design Inc. 7 Doris Avenue East Jacksonville, NC 28540	76512	5%	✓	✓	\$1,020,000.00	\$3,600.00	\$110,000.00	\$1,133,600.00
ATD Building Group 3001 Wrightsville Ave. Wilmington, NC 28403								No Bid
Delphi Construction Inc PO Box 308 Jacksonville, NC 28541								No Bid
Waters Contracting Company Inc. 3931 Hwy 24 Newport, NC 28570								No Bid
Muter Construction LLC 111 E. Vance Street Zebulon, NC	73095	5%	✓	✓	\$1,135,000.00	\$2,600.00	\$59,500.00	\$1,197,100.00

Patrick S. McConnell
 REGISTERED ARCHITECT
 11849
 NORTH CAROLINA
 RALEIGH, NC
 11-15-2020